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EMERA INCORPORATED 

BOARD OF DIRECTORS CHARTER 
 
The fundamental responsibility of the Board of Directors (the “Board”) is to provide 
stewardship and governance to Emera Incorporated (“Emera”) for the long term success 
of the Company by overseeing management of the business.   
 
In addition to the powers set out in Emera’s Articles of Association, the Board shall have 
the following duties and responsibilities. 
 
Strategic Planning 
 
The Board shall provide oversight and guidance on the strategic issues facing Emera.  
 
The Board shall oversee a strategic planning process resulting in a strategic plan which 
shall be approved on an annual basis and will take into account, among other things, the 
opportunities and risks of the business.  
 
The Board shall regularly consider Emera’s strategy, evaluate progress made in 
pursuing that strategy, and consider any adjustments to the strategy that may be 
required from time to time. 
 
The Board shall review and approve the Company’s financial objectives, plans and 
actions, including significant capital allocations and expenditures. 
 
The Board shall review and approve all material acquisitions, dispositions, projects, 
business plans, and budgets. 
 
Culture  
 
The Board shall oversee management’s approach to addressing Emera’s 
Environmental, Social and Governance (ESG) impacts, risks and opportunities which are 
most important to its business performance and to key stakeholders. 
 
The Board shall be comprised of a majority of “independent directors” as defined from 
time to time under applicable legislation and the rules of any stock exchange on which 
Emera’s securities are listed for trading. 

 
The Chair shall be an “independent director” as defined above. 

 
The Board shall review and approve standards for ethical business conduct for 
employees, officers and directors of Emera and its subsidiaries and affiliates and a 
procedure for monitoring compliance with such code throughout the Company.  

 
The Board shall satisfy itself as to the integrity of the Chief Executive Officer and 
executive officers and management’s creation of an integrity-based culture throughout 
the Company. 
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Risk Responsibility 
 
The Board shall oversee the implementation by management of appropriate systems to 
identify, report, and manage the principal risks of Emera’s business.  The Board will 
consider Emera’s risk profile and oversee Emera’s risk management by reviewing:  
 
(a) the regular identification and assessment of the principal risks of Emera;  
 
(b) the process for ongoing monitoring and reporting of the principal risks of Emera; 
 
(c)  the effectiveness of Emera’s mitigation response to its principal risks; 
 
(d)  the alignment of risk management with Emera’s risk profile, its strategy, and its 
organizational objectives, including capital and resources allocation. 
 
The Board shall also review Emera’s annual insurance program and uninsured exposure 
and Emera’s business continuity and disaster recovery plans. 
 
The Board shall receive regular updates on the status of risk management activities and 
initiatives. 
 
The Board shall review management’s processes that provide reasonable assurance of 
compliance with applicable legal and regulatory requirements. 
 
Leadership and Succession 
 
The Board shall oversee policies and practices to enable the Company to attract, 
develop and retain the human resources required by the Company to meet its business 
objectives. 
 
The Board shall appoint executive officers and delegate the necessary authority for the 
conduct of the business.  
 
The Board shall establish annual performance expectations and corporate goals and 
objectives for the Chief Executive Officer and monitor progress against those 
expectations.  
 
The Board shall evaluate the performance, and, following a review of recommendations 
from the Management Resources and Compensation Committee, approve 
compensation for executive officers. 
 
The Board shall oversee the succession planning program for the Chief Executive 
Officer and other key executive positions from time to time. 
 
Financial 
 
The Board shall oversee the financial reporting and disclosure obligations imposed on 
the Company by laws, regulations, rules, policies and other applicable requirements. 
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The Board will review the financial performance of the Company and declare dividends 
as appropriate. 
 
The Board shall approve for release to the public as necessary the Company’s financial 
statements, management’s discussion and analysis (MD&A) and earnings releases 
prepared by management and oversee the Company’s compliance with applicable audit, 
accounting and reporting requirements.  
 
The Board shall review the quality and integrity of Emera’s internal controls and 
management information systems. 
 
Corporate Communications and Public Disclosure 

 
The Board shall review and approve a formal corporate disclosure policy and oversee 
policies and processes for accurate, timely and appropriate public disclosure. 
 
The Board shall oversee systems for receiving feedback from stakeholders and review 
such feedback received by the Company. 
 
Governance Responsibility 
 
The Board is responsible for overseeing the Company’s corporate governance policies 
and practices and shall maintain a set of corporate governance practices that are 
specifically appropriate to the Company. 
 
Pursuant to the Articles, the directors shall appoint one of the directors as Chair of the 
Board and such director shall not be an employee of Emera or any of its affiliates or 
subsidiaries. 
 
The Board shall establish appropriate structures and procedures to allow the Board to 
function independently of management and in the interests of the Company and its 
shareholders. 
 
The Board, in carrying out its mandate, shall appoint committees of the Board and 
delegate certain functions to those committees, each of which shall have its own written 
charter.  Notwithstanding such delegation, the Board retains its oversight function and 
ultimate responsibility for these delegated functions. 
 
The Board shall oversee a process for the selection of qualified individuals for board 
nomination, and shall approve selection criteria for identifying director candidates taking 
into account the competencies and skills the Board as a whole should possess. 
 
The Board shall undertake regular evaluation of the Board, the Chair of the Board, the 
Board committees and individual Directors. 
 
The Board shall undertake regular evaluation of Directors’ compensation. 
 
The Board shall review this Charter annually to ensure it appropriately reflects the 
Board’s stewardship responsibilities. 
 


